
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Bid Ref #: 47537-001.0; Term Contract for EMS Supplies & Equipment

Recorded by:  ATTENDED BY:

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT

68.04$                          1,701.00$                     29.51$                          737.75$                        35.00$                          875.00$                        65.00$                          1,300.00$                     

103.55$                        310.65$                        30.27$                          90.81$                          28.09$                          84.27$                          22.50$                          67.50$                          

221.85$                        665.55$                        27.19$                          81.57$                          32.06$                          96.18$                          22.50$                          67.50$                          

32.80$                          328.00$                        7.52$                             75.20$                          97.65$                          976.50$                        76.50$                          765.00$                        

115.35$                        230.70$                        92.05$                          184.10$                        23.59$                          47.18$                          15.00$                          30.00$                          

6
DYN4516-DYNAREX INSTANT HOT 

PACK - 5" x 9', 24/Case
1 Case  $                          17.14  $                          17.14  $                          25.30  $                          25.30  $                             8.40  $                             8.40 73.86$                          73.86$                          24.71$                          24.71$                          24.34$                          24.34$                          15.00$                          30.00$                          

7

ADC419-ADC ADTEMP 

HYPOTHERMIA THERMOMETER 

Digital Hypothermia Thermometer, 

12/case

20 Each  $                             5.24  $                        104.80  $                             5.91  $                        118.20  $                             6.05  $                        121.00 10.86$                          217.20$                        86.11$                          1,722.20$                     7.29$                             145.80$                        121.00$                        1,210.00$                     

8

TLMD12843B50-INFANT THERMAL 

HATS WITH PLASTIC VAPOR 

BARRIER - Newborn, 50/Box

10 Each  $                             0.45  $                             4.50  $                             1.26  $                          12.60  $                             0.92  $                             9.20 NO BID NO BID 6.59$                             65.90$                          4.49$                             44.90$                          432.00$                        4,320.00$                     

9

BUS388-BUSSE OBSTETRICAL KITS 

OB, Kit In Pouch, 10/Case, See product 

detail page for contents

2 Case  $                          48.30  $                          96.60  $                        111.50  $                        223.00  $                          79.80  $                        159.60 175.55$                        351.10$                        125.99$                        251.98$                        129.88$                        259.76$                        73.00$                          146.00$                        

10

ISU8704030-INTERSURGICAL I-GEL 

SUPRAGLOTTIC O2 RESUS PACK - 

Medium Adult 110-200 LBS, Green, 1 

Kit/Each, 6 Kit/Case

20 Each  $                          26.45  $                        529.00  $                          31.11  $                        622.20  $                          25.99  $                        519.80 74.78$                          1,495.60$                     46.79$                          935.80$                        26.96$                          539.20$                        292.00$                        5,840.00$                     

11

SU8703030-INTERSURGICAL I-GEL 

SUPRAGLOTTIC O2 RESUS PACK - 

Small Adult 65-160 LBS, Yellow, 1 

Kit/Each, 6 Kit/Case

20 Each  $                          26.45  $                        529.00  $                          31.11  $                        622.20  $                          25.99  $                        519.80 74.78$                          1,495.60$                     46.79$                          935.80$                        26.96$                          539.20$                        292.00$                        5,840.00$                     

12

SU8705030-INTERSURGICAL I-GEL 

SUPRAGLOTTIC O2 RESUS PACK - 

Large Adult 200+ LBS, Orange, 1 

Kit/Each, 6 Kit/Case

20 Each  $                          26.45  $                        529.00  $                          31.11  $                        622.20  $                          25.99  $                        519.80 74.78$                          1,495.60$                     46.79$                          935.80$                        26.96$                          539.20$                        292.00$                        5,840.00$                     

13
MSOMS-70031-Stethoscope, Dual 

Head Scope, Black, 50/Case
10 Each  $                             2.25  $                          22.50  $                             4.82  $                          48.20  $                             3.94  $                          39.40 8.24$                             82.40$                          4.23$                             42.30$                          4.35$                             43.50$                          140.00$                        1,400.00$                     

14

AMB000-281-000-AMBU PERFIT 

ACE ADJUSTABLE EXTRICATION 

COLLAR, White & Light Grey, 16 

Adjustments (Neckless, Short, Regular 

and Tall)

10 Each  $                             4.11  $                          41.10  $                             8.38  $                          83.80  $                             4.92  $                          49.20 19.49$                          194.90$                        6.74$                             67.40$                          4.36$                             43.60$                          18.00$                          180.00$                        

15

AMB000-281-106-AMBU PERFIT 

ACE MINI ADJUSTABLE 

EXTRICATION COLLAR, 3 Sizes 

(Infant, Child, Small Adult)

10 Each  $                             4.11  $                          41.10  $                             8.38  $                          83.80  $                             4.92  $                          49.20 19.49$                          194.90$                        6.74$                             67.40$                          130.63$                        130.63$                        358.00$                        358.00$                        

16

MSOMS-SPLNT-Flex-All Splint (Sam 

Splint), Orange, 4" x 36" Moldable Splint 

100/Case

30 Each  $                             3.00  $                          90.00  $                             7.09  $                        212.70  $                             5.62  $                        168.60 20.70$                          621.00$                        7.68$                             230.40$                        5.35$                             160.50$                        25.00$                          750.00$                        

18

ALL21030-ALLIED HEALTHCARE 

PRODUCT REGULATOR BARD 

OUTLET 0-25 LPM W/GAUGE, 

CGA870

12 Each  $                          38.33  $                        459.96  $                        111.31  $                     1,335.72  $                          95.86  $                     1,150.32 NO BID NO BID 566.67$                        6,800.04$                     108.06$                        1,296.72$                     87.50$                          262.50$                        

19

KIM46727-FLUIDSHIELD N95 

PARTICULATE FILTER RESPIRATOR 

& SURGICAL MASK, Regular Size,  

35/Package, 210/Case

6 Case  $                        258.96  $                     1,553.76  $                        582.15  $                     3,492.90  $                        251.10  $                     1,506.60 712.37$                        4,274.22$                     841.61$                        5,049.66$                     81.47$                          488.82$                        642.00$                        3,852.00$                     

20
AMB000-252-103-RES-CUE MASK 

BASIC RED HARD CASE
50 Each  $                             2.55  $                        127.50  $                          17.74  $                        887.00  $                             4.20  $                        210.00 NO BID NO BID 16.72$                          836.00$                        7.69$                             384.50$                        377.00$                        377.00$                        

21

KIM55083-KC500 PURPLE NITRILE 

EXAM GLOVES, large, non-sterile, non-

cuffed, non-walleted, 9.5", 

chemotherapy approved, ambidexterous, 

100/box, 10 boxes/case

20 Case  $                          66.70  $                     1,334.00  $                        103.25  $                     2,065.00  $                          97.30  $                     1,946.00 59.96$                          1,199.20$                     347.38$                        6,947.60$                     234.58$                        4,691.60$                     7.50$                             1,500.00$                     

22

KIM55082-KC500 PURPLE NITRILE 

EXAM GLOVES, medium, non-sterile, 

non-cuffed, non-walleted, 9.5", 

chemotherapy approved, ambidexterous, 

100/box, 10 boxes/case

20 Case  $                          66.70  $                     1,334.00  $                        103.25  $                     2,065.00  $                          97.30  $                     1,946.00 59.96$                          1,199.20$                     347.38$                        6,947.60$                     234.58$                        4,691.60$                     7.50$                             1,500.00$                     

23

KIM55081-KC500 PURPLE NITRILE 

EXAM GLOVES, small, non-sterile, non-

cuffed, non-walleted, 9.5", 

chemotherapy approved, ambidexterous, 

100/box, 10 boxes/case

20 Case  $                          66.70  $                     1,334.00  $                        103.25  $                     2,065.00  $                          97.30  $                     1,946.00 59.96$                          1,199.20$                     347.38$                        6,947.60$                     221.22$                        4,424.40$                     7.50$                             1,500.00$                     

24

KIM55084-KC500 PURPLE NITRILE 

EXAM GLOVES, x-large, non-sterile, 

non-cuffed, non-walleted, 9.5", 

chemotherapy approved, ambidexterous, 

90/box, 10 boxes/case

20 Case  $                          66.70  $                     1,334.00  $                        103.25  $                     2,065.00  $                          97.30  $                     1,946.00 59.96$                          1,199.20$                     347.38$                        6,947.60$                     194.02$                        3,880.40$                     7.50$                             1,500.00$                     

25

AMRA5220-AMD-RITMED SILK 

SURGICAL TAPE, 2" x 10 yd, 6/Box, 12 

Boxes/Case

5 Box  $                             8.26  $                          41.30  $                             7.71  $                          38.55  $                             7.85  $                          39.25 16.75$                          83.75$                          2,162.82$                     2,162.82$                     10.40$                          52.00$                          54.00$                          270.00$                        

26

COV8534C-COVIDIEN CLEAR TAPE 

Clear Tape, Hypoallergenic, 1" x 10 yds, 

12/Box, 10 Boxes/Case

5 Box  $                             6.35  $                          31.75  $                          12.00  $                          60.00  $                          10.95  $                          54.75 12.20$                          61.00$                          15.14$                          75.70$                          159.80$                        159.80$                        33.00$                          165.00$                        

27

PROP150160-PRO ADVANTAGE 

NON-ADHERENT STERILE PADS Non-

Adherent Sterile Pads, 3" x 4", 100/bx, 

12 bx/cs

10 Box  $                          11.15  $                        111.50  $                          10.73  $                        107.30  $                             5.82  $                          58.20 13.17$                          131.70$                        106.89$                        106.89$                        6.09$                             60.90$                          49.00$                          490.00$                        

28

COV441000-DERMACEA GAUZE 

SPONGES, 4" X 4" STE 12-PLY 2`S, 

2/Package, 50/Box, 1200/Case

36 Box  $                             1.62  $                          58.32  $                             1.94  $                          69.84  $                             2.30  $                          82.80 NO BID NO BID 67.85$                          67.85$                          82.44$                          82.44$                          37.00$                          37.00$                          

29

COV441505-CONFORMING 

BANDAGES 3" X 4.1 YDS STERILE 

ROLL, 96/Case

5 Case  $                          19.84  $                          99.20  $                          26.96  $                        134.80  $                          32.32  $                        161.60 79.55$                          397.75$                        44.50$                          222.50$                        16.86$                          84.30$                          21.00$                          21.00$                          

30

COV3324-COVIDIEN KERLIX GAUZE 

ROLLS, Non-Sterile, 6 ply, Bulk & 

Packed 12's, 4.5" x 4.1 yds, 12/Box, 4 

Boxes/Case

50 Box  $                          24.45  $                     1,222.50  $                          16.46  $                        823.00  $                             6.60  $                        330.00 39.72$                          1,986.00$                     30.13$                          1,506.50$                     27.78$                          1,389.00$                     67.00$                          1,675.00$                     

31

DYN3683-DYNAREX EMERGENCY 

HIGH STRENGTH PRESSURE 

BANDAGES - 4", Sterile, Latex-Free, 

100/Case

30 Each  $                             2.78  $                          83.40  $                             3.93  $                        117.90  $                             3.02  $                          90.60 NO BID NO BID 4.06$                             121.80$                        4.18$                             125.40$                        327.00$                        327.00$                        

32
TMS84-0009-SOF TOURNIQUET, 

Black
30 Each  $                             8.52  $                        255.60  $                          24.94  $                        748.20  $                          20.81  $                        624.30 71.33$                          2,139.90$                     36.50$                          1,095.00$                     29.40$                          882.00$                        54.00$                          1,620.00$                     

33

COV5750-CURITY ALCOHOL PREP 

PADS, Medium, Sterile, 200/bx, 20 

bx/cs

24 Box  $                             1.15  $                          27.60  $                             1.79  $                          42.96  $                             1.56  $                          37.44 5.43$                             130.32$                        1.46$                             35.04$                          3.06$                             73.44$                          2.00$                             960.00$                        

34

PDIB40600-PDI POVIDONE IODINE 

PREP PADS Medium Povidone Iodine 

Prep Pads, 100 pk/bx, 10 bx/cs

24 Box  $                             3.72  $                          89.28  $                             5.78  $                        138.72  $                             4.15  $                          99.60 11.06$                          265.44$                        6.66$                             159.84$                        3.64$                             87.36$                          42.00$                          1,008.00$                     

35

DYN1182-DYNAREX OINTMENTS, 

Triple Antibiotic Ointment, .9g Foil 

Packet, 144/Box, 12 Boxes/Case

5 Box  $                          11.20  $                          56.00  $                             8.35  $                          41.75  $                          10.89  $                          54.45 16.42$                          82.10$                          26.74$                          133.70$                        18.53$                          92.65$                          171.00$                        855.00$                        

36

SAF34400-SAFETEC P.A.W.S. 

PERSONAL ANTIMICROBIAL WIPES 

Individually Wrapped Towelettes, Fresh 

Scent, 100/bx, 10 bx/cs

50 Box  $                             5.04  $                        252.00  $                             6.25  $                        312.50  $                             5.85  $                        292.50 NO BID NO BID 6.43$                             321.50$                        7.12$                             356.00$                        37.00$                          1,850.00$                     

37

BBRR5001-01-B BRAUN 

IRRIGATION/UROLOGY SOLUTIONS 

500mL Sterile Water For Irrigation USP 

in Plastic Container, 16/cs

25 Each  $                             3.24  $                          81.00  $                             3.44  $                          86.00  $                             4.21  $                        105.25 5.30$                             132.50$                        4.31$                             107.75$                        3.13$                             78.25$                          51.00$                          1,275.00$                     

38
LRD985001-V-VAC REPLACEMENT 

CARTRIDGE
24 Each  $                          27.39  $                        657.36  $                          23.10  $                        554.40  $                          26.33  $                        631.92 73.98$                          1,775.52$                     33.55$                          805.20$                        28.06$                          673.44$                        56.00$                          1,344.00$                     

39
LRD985002-V-VAC ADAPTER TIP, 

4/package
6 Package  $                          34.95  $                        209.70  $                          38.10  $                        228.60  $                          31.65  $                        189.90 109.46$                        656.76$                        41.96$                          251.76$                        35.09$                          210.54$                        66.00$                          396.00$                        

40
LRD985000-V-VAC STARTER KIT, 

manual suction unit
10 Kit  $                        129.53  $                     1,295.30  NO BID  NO BID  $                        125.30  $                     1,253.00 275.72$                        2,757.20$                     NO BID NO BID 130.94$                        1,309.40$                     192.00$                        1,920.00$                     

41
LRD985030-V-VAC REPLACEMENT 

HANDLE
10 Each  $                        123.04  $                     1,230.40  $                        132.85  $                     1,328.50  $                        117.13  $                     1,171.30 285.40$                        2,854.00$                     146.04$                        146.04$                        119.69$                        1,196.90$                     238.00$                        2,380.00$                     

42

DER99990-ECONOMY ADHESIVE 

BANDAGES, flexible fabric, 1" x 3", 

100/bx, 36 bx/cs

30 Box  $                             1.51  $                          45.30  $                             1.90  $                          57.00  $                             2.02  $                          60.60 3.55$                             106.50$                        2.79$                             83.70$                          3.19$                             95.70$                          69.50$                          2,085.00$                     

43

COV8884433500-COVIDIEN 

XEROFORM PETROLATUM GAUZE 

DRESSING 4" x 4" Patch Peelable Foil 

Packs, 25/Box 150/cs

2 Box  $                          11.55  $                          23.10  $                          34.99  $                          69.98  $                          23.54  $                          47.08 48.65$                          97.30$                          39.27$                          78.54$                          12.69$                          25.38$                          35.00$                          70.00$                          

44
DYN3680-TRIANGULAR BANDAGE, 

40" x 40" x 56", 12/cs
2 Box  $                             4.20  $                             8.40  $                             6.96  $                          13.92  $                             4.30  $                             8.60 9.91$                             19.82$                          7.50$                             15.00$                          8.06$                             16.12$                          7.00$                             14.00$                          

45
MSOMS-BS0033-MedSource Sterile 

Burn Sheet - 60in x 90in, 50/Case
10 Each  $                             1.83  $                          18.30  $                             2.12  $                          21.20  $                             2.52  $                          25.20 3.71$                             37.10$                          4.06$                             40.60$                          2.27$                             22.70$                          37.50$                          37.50$                          

46

MMC6739-TRANSCEND GLUCOSE 

GEL, Strawberry Flavor, 15gm, 3/Pack, 

12Packs/Case

13 Pack  $                             4.64  $                          60.32  $                             5.14  $                          66.82  $                          11.85  $                        154.05 9.92$                             128.96$                        5.00$                             65.00$                          12.18$                          158.34$                        24.00$                          312.00$                        

47
MSOMS-BP200-BLOOD PRESSURE 

UNIT, Large Adult
10 Each  $                             5.44  $                          54.40  $                             8.29  $                          82.90  $                             6.80  $                          68.00 38.81$                          388.10$                        11.51$                          115.10$                        34.83$                          348.30$                        110.00$                        220.00$                        

48
MSOMS-BP100-BLOOD PRESSURE 

UNIT, Adult
10 Each  $                             5.24  $                          52.40  $                             7.96  $                          79.60  $                             6.18  $                          61.80 36.84$                          368.40$                        10.40$                          104.00$                        32.14$                          321.40$                        94.00$                          188.00$                        

49
MSOMS-BP400-BLOOD PRESSURE 

UNIT, Infant
10 Each  $                             6.77  $                          67.70  $                             8.29  $                          82.90  $                             6.28  $                          62.80 36.84$                          368.40$                        10.33$                          103.30$                        9.39$                             93.90$                          80.00$                          160.00$                        

50
MSOMS-BP300-BLOOD PRESSURE 

UNIT, Pediatric
10 Each  $                             5.06  $                          50.60  $                             8.29  $                          82.90  $                             6.18  $                          61.80 36.84$                          368.40$                        10.33$                          103.30$                        9.81$                             98.10$                          74.00$                          148.00$                        

51
COM401-S-HEAD-ON SYSTEM W/ 

STRAPS 2 Bags 1 Occipital Pad
1 Case  $                          63.00  $                          63.00  $                        259.03  $                        259.03  $                        154.40  $                        154.40 NO BID NO BID 661.93$                        661.93$                        7.32$                             7.32$                             15.00$                          30.00$                          

52

KIM45094-KLEENGUARD A60 

ZIPPER FRONT STORM FLAP 

COVERALLS, With Hood & Boots, X-

Large, 24/Case

1 Case  $                        128.16  $                        128.16  $                          91.14  $                          91.14  $                        136.08  $                        136.08 NO BID NO BID 374.81$                        374.81$                        107.59$                        107.59$                        255.00$                        255.00$                        

53 DC4010T-ADC BITE STICK, 10/Pack 2 Package  $                             2.74  $                             5.48  $                             4.75  $                             9.50  $                             4.40  $                             8.80 127.63$                        255.26$                        4.01$                             8.02$                             6.44$                             12.88$                          13.00$                          26.00$                          

54

GKR7000HP-VOMIT & URINE BAG, 

white, opaque, w/ hand protector, 

240/case

50 Each  $                             0.76  $                          38.00  $                             1.42  $                          71.00  $                             1.01  $                          50.50 3.38$                             169.00$                        434.35$                        434.35$                        0.44$                             22.00$                          631.42$                        31,571.00$                   

55
DUK721-SILVER SURVIVAL WRAP, 

heat reflective, 52" x 84", 250/case
20 Each  $                             0.45  $                             9.00  $                             0.68  $                          13.60  $                             0.54  $                          10.80 0.90$                             18.00$                          1.09$                             21.80$                          181.34$                        3,626.80$                     146.00$                        2,920.00$                     

56

KIM62114-HALYARD SPECIALTY 

FACE MASKS,  Protector Procedure 

Mask, Level 2, Pleat with Earloop, 

Splash Resistant with Visor, Fog-Free, 

Blue, 25/Box, 4 Boxes/Case

1 Box  $                          23.17  $                          23.17  $                          31.55  $                          31.55  $                          23.45  $                          23.45 38.60$                          38.60$                          30.79$                          30.79$                          25.73$                          25.73$                          185.00$                        185.00$                        

57

PSPS3210S-ALAIR S3210S SAFETY 

GLASSES - Clear Lens, Clear Temples, 

12/Box

15 Each  $                             1.82  $                          27.30  $                             1.38  $                          20.70  $                             1.36  $                          20.40 3.24$                             48.60$                          1.94$                             29.10$                          1.72$                             25.80$                          53.00$                          212.00$                        

58

MRC10-56436-SMALL ADULT CPR-2 

BAG - Oxygen bag reservoir, 

Manometer, Exhalation Filter, Adult 

Cushion Mask, 6/Box

20 Each  $                          16.64  $                        332.80  $                          22.75  $                        455.00  $                          17.50  $                        350.00 NO BID NO BID 117.20$                        117.20$                        203.86$                        815.44$                        250.52$                        5,010.40$                     

59

AMB530-214-000-AMBU SPUR II 

DISPOSABLE RESUSCITATOR 

Pediatric Bag with 3 Masks

20 Each  $                          11.66  $                        233.20  $                          26.56  $                        531.20  $                          14.59  $                        291.80 45.75$                          915.00$                        219.87$                        4,397.40$                     16.91$                          338.20$                        382.00$                        764.00$                        

60

MSOMS-24003-MEDSOURCE OVER-

THE-EAR NASAL CANNULA, 

w/Nonflared Nasal Tips, 7ft. Tubing, 

50/Case

25 Each  $                             0.32  $                             8.00  $                             0.36  $                             9.00  $                             0.24  $                             6.00 2.99$                             74.75$                          0.76$                             19.00$                          0.68$                             17.00$                          25.00$                          500.00$                        

61
ALL33505-NASAL CANNULAS Infant 

Clear Cannula w/  7 ft Tubing, 25/cs
25 Each  $                             1.11  $                          27.75  $                             3.73  $                          93.25  $                             1.34  $                          33.50 3.56$                             89.00$                          4.63$                             115.75$                        90.37$                          90.37$                          24.00$                          288.00$                        

62

DYN36312-ORAL AIRWAYS KIT, 

Contains: One Kit Of Each Size/Box, 6 

Boxes/Case

20 Box  $                             3.07  $                          61.40  $                             3.35  $                          67.00  $                             1.94  $                          38.80 70.13$                          1,402.60$                     48.13$                          962.60$                        26.64$                          106.56$                        37.50$                          750.00$                        

63

MSOMS-25060-MEDSOURCE 

INTERNATIONAL OXYGEN MASKS, 

Complete Non-Rebreather, 50/cs

25 Each  $                             0.74  $                          18.50  $                             0.92  $                          23.00  $                             0.74  $                          18.50 6.44$                             161.00$                        1.44$                             36.00$                          53.69$                          1,342.25$                     111.00$                        2,775.00$                     

64

MSOMS-25058-MEDSOURCE 

INTERNATIONAL OXYGEN MASKS, 

Pediatric Non-Rebreather, 50/Case

25 Each  $                             1.26  $                          31.50  $                             1.49  $                          37.25  $                             0.74  $                          18.50 4.49$                             112.25$                        1.87$                             46.75$                          2.72$                             68.00$                          164.00$                        4,100.00$                     

65

MSOMS-25055-U-PVC NON-

REBREATHER MASK - Infant, Under 

the lip, with Universal Connector, 

50/Case

25 Each  $                             1.40  $                          35.00  $                             1.27  $                          31.75  $                             1.00  $                          25.00 3.68$                             92.00$                          1.85$                             46.25$                          1.71$                             42.75$                          141.00$                        3,525.00$                     

66
FEI12-1926-BASELINE FINGERTIP 

PULSE OXIMETER - Standard
8 Each  $                          16.05  $                        128.40  $                          17.95  $                        143.60  $                          35.96  $                        287.68 149.99$                        1,199.92$                     54.14$                          433.12$                        16.49$                          131.92$                        315.00$                        315.00$                        

67
MALEASYCAP2-EASY CAP II END 

TIDAL ADULT CO2 DETECTOR
40 Each  $                             9.64  $                        385.60  $                          10.23  $                        409.20  $                             9.54  $                        381.60 43.82$                          1,752.80$                     13.54$                          541.60$                        18.02$                          720.80$                        31.00$                          1,240.00$                     

68

LRD600-42500-THOMAS SELECT 

ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE HOLDER - 

Adult, 25/Box

40 Each  $                             3.72  $                        148.80  $                             4.09  $                        163.60  $                             3.62  $                        144.80 9.44$                             377.60$                        4.56$                             182.40$                        3.75$                             150.00$                        205.00$                        8,200.00$                     

** Quanitities vary per substitue product 

Right Way

57.50$                          1,725.00$                     

* Corrected Pricing

 $                             0.81  $                          24.30 

 $                          12.88 

 $                        608.75 

 $                          29.20  $                          87.60 

 $                          22.05  $                          66.15 

 $                             6.32  $                          63.20 

 $                          10.08  $                          20.16 

 $                             0.67  $                          20.10 

 $                          35.52 
DYN4512-DYNAREX INSTANT COLD 

PACK - 5" x 9", 24/Case

 $                          24.00  $                          72.00 

 $                          24.00  $                          72.00 

 $                          64.40 

 $                          24.51  $                          49.02 

DYN36281-DYNAREX LATEX-FREE 

NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY - 32 

FR, 10/Box

DYN1251-DYNAREX LUBRICATING 

JELLY - Sterile, 5g Packets, 72/Box, 12 

Boxes/Case

 $                             5.38  $                          53.80 

 $                          58.80 

 $                          17.76 5 2 Case

4 10 Box

17 30 Each  $                             0.63  $                          18.90 
MSOMS-SH001B-EMT SHEARS, 7 

1/4",

Black, 50/Box

2

DYN36275-DYNAREX LATEX-FREE 

NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY - 20 

FR, 10/Box

3 Box  $                          19.60 

3 3 Box  $                          19.60  $                          58.80 

CITY OF KALAMAZOO BID TAB

Bid Opening:   March 28, 2024 @ 4:30 p.m. 

Opened by: 

1 25 Each  $                          23.92  $                        598.00  $                          26.79  $                        669.75  $                          24.35 

NAR30-0001-C-A-T BLACK 

TOURNIQUET COMBAT 

APPLICATION

Henry Schien, Inc. 
McKesson Medical-Surgical 

Government Solutions LLC
Bound Tree Medical, LLC

1.50$                             45.00$                          3.74$                             112.20$                        

Medline

9.56$                             286.80$                        

Single Source Procurement 
Agni Enterprizes LLC (dba) 

Head to Heels Safety Supplies


